

**Time by File
Beginning thru End**

A19-00656 - Lesko, Stulberg and Wieder v City, FOIA Lawsuit Circuit Court

Date	Staff	Task	Hours
6/13/2019	Betsy Blake	Meeting	1.00
8/12/2019	Christopher Frost	Draft Document	3.50
5/29/2019	Matt Thomas	Legal Research	2.00
6/7/2019	Matt Thomas	Discussion	1.50
6/10/2019	Matt Thomas	Draft Document	2.00
6/11/2019	Matt Thomas	Draft Document	1.50
6/18/2019	Matt Thomas	File/Factual Matter Research	1.50
6/19/2019	Matt Thomas	File/Factual Matter Research	2.50
6/19/2019	Matt Thomas	Administrative	1.00
6/25/2019	Matt Thomas	File/Factual Matter Research	1.00
6/26/2019	Matt Thomas	Administrative	4.00
7/2/2019	Matt Thomas	Draft Document	1.50
7/8/2019	Matt Thomas	Meeting	0.50
7/8/2019	Matt Thomas	Review	1.00
7/11/2019	Matt Thomas	Legal Research	2.50
7/12/2019	Matt Thomas	Legal Research	1.50
7/19/2019	Matt Thomas	File/Factual Matter Research	2.50
7/23/2019	Matt Thomas	Administrative	1.50
7/23/2019	Matt Thomas	Review	1.50
7/25/2019	Matt Thomas	Legal Research	3.50
7/25/2019	Matt Thomas	Review	2.50
7/26/2019	Matt Thomas	Draft Document	2.50
8/13/2019	Matt Thomas	Review	1.50
8/14/2019	Matt Thomas	Draft Document	5.00
8/14/2019	Matt Thomas	Legal Research	1.50
8/15/2019	Matt Thomas	Review	1.00
8/15/2019	Matt Thomas	Draft Document	3.50
8/15/2019	Matt Thomas	Legal Research	1.50
8/16/2019	Matt Thomas	Review	2.50
8/22/2019	Matt Thomas	Administrative	1.00

Time by File
Beginning thru End

A19-00656 - Lesko, Stulberg and Wieder v City, FOIA Lawsuit Circuit Court

Date	Staff	Task	Hours
8/23/2019	Matt Thomas	Review	1.00
8/24/2019	Matt Thomas	Administrative	1.00
8/26/2019	Matt Thomas	Legal Research	2.00
8/26/2019	Matt Thomas	Draft Document	2.50
8/27/2019	Matt Thomas	Draft Document	3.50
8/28/2019	Matt Thomas	Draft Document	2.50
8/29/2019	Matt Thomas	Draft Document	2.50
9/18/2019	Matt Thomas	Administrative	2.00
9/23/2019	Matt Thomas	Court Preparation	2.50
9/24/2019	Matt Thomas	Court Preparation	4.00
9/25/2019	Matt Thomas	Court	3.50
9/25/2019	Matt Thomas	Court Preparation	3.00
9/27/2019	Matt Thomas	Administrative	2.50
10/2/2019	Matt Thomas	Administrative	3.50
10/21/2019	Matt Thomas	Draft Document	2.00
10/23/2019	Matt Thomas	Draft Document	0.50
10/25/2019	Matt Thomas	Administrative	6.00
			100.00 Subtotal
5/28/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	0.50
6/3/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Legal Research	1.50
6/4/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	1.50
6/5/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	1.25
6/6/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	1.00
6/10/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	2.50
6/10/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Legal Research	0.50
6/11/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	0.75
6/11/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Legal Research	0.50
6/13/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Meeting	0.50
6/30/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Uncoded	2.00
7/2/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	1.50
7/8/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Draft Document	1.50
7/11/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Legal Research	1.50

**Time by File
Beginning thru End**

A19-00656 - Lesko, Stulberg and Wieder v City, FOIA Lawsuit Circuit Court

Date	Staff	Task	Hours
7/19/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Legal Research	1.25
7/19/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Meeting	4.50
7/22/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	1.25
7/23/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	0.50
7/29/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	1.50
7/30/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Discussion	2.00
7/31/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	0.25
7/31/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Discussion	2.00
8/1/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	1.50
8/7/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	1.25
8/9/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Draft Document	2.50
8/12/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Draft Document	1.75
8/13/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Draft Document	2.25
8/14/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Draft Document	2.25
8/15/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	0.50
8/15/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Draft Document	3.50
8/16/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	1.25
8/26/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Draft Document	0.75
8/27/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Draft Document	2.50
8/28/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Draft Document	4.50
8/30/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Draft Document	1.25
9/3/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	0.50
9/21/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Court Preparation	6.50
9/23/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Court Preparation	4.50
9/24/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Court Preparation	3.50
9/25/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Court	6.50
10/9/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Draft Document	1.25
10/18/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	0.50
10/21/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Draft Document	0.50
10/25/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	2.75
11/15/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	0.50
11/18/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Administrative	0.75

**Time by File
Beginning thru End**

A19-00656 - Lesko, Stulberg and Wieder v City, FOIA Lawsuit Circuit Court

Date	Staff	Task	Hours
1/9/2020	Stephen K. Postema	Telephone calls	0.25
			84.00 Subtotal
9/16/2019	Timothy S. Wilhelm	Review	1.50
9/17/2019	Timothy S. Wilhelm	Review	2.00
9/19/2019	Timothy S. Wilhelm	Review	1.50
9/20/2019	Timothy S. Wilhelm	Legal Research	3.50
9/23/2019	Timothy S. Wilhelm	Discussion	0.50
9/23/2019	Timothy S. Wilhelm	Legal Research	2.00
9/24/2019	Timothy S. Wilhelm	Legal Research	4.00
9/25/2019	Timothy S. Wilhelm	Legal Research	2.00
			17.00 Subtotal
			205.50 Grand Total Hours

Time by File
Beginning thru End

A19-00336 - Tom Stulberg, et al v City - Zoning Lawsuit re: Lowertown

Date	Staff	Task	Hours
4/10/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	0.50
5/8/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	0.25
5/9/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	0.25
5/10/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	1.25
5/23/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	0.75
5/28/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	0.25
5/29/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	0.25
5/30/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	1.00
6/5/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	0.25
6/6/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	0.50
6/7/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	1.50
6/10/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	1.00
6/15/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	1.25
6/17/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	1.50
6/18/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	0.50
6/19/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	0.25
6/25/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	2.00
6/26/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	1.50
7/10/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	0.50
7/15/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	1.00
7/16/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	2.25
7/18/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	1.25
7/19/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	2.75
7/25/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	1.00
8/14/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	0.50
8/15/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	0.50
8/16/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	0.75
8/19/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	0.50
8/20/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	2.25
8/21/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	0.25
9/17/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	0.25
9/26/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	0.25

**Time by File
Beginning thru End**

A19-00336 - Tom Stulberg, et al v City - Zoning Lawsuit re: Lowertown

Date	Staff	Task	Hours
10/2/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	0.25
10/28/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	0.50
10/29/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	0.50
11/7/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	0.25
11/8/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	0.25
12/23/2019	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	0.25
1/7/2020	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	1.00
1/8/2020	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	1.50
1/9/2020	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	0.25
1/16/2020	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	0.25
1/17/2020	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	0.25
1/20/2020	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	0.50
1/21/2020	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	4.00
1/22/2020	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	2.00
1/23/2020	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	0.50
1/24/2020	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	2.00
1/27/2020	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	2.25
1/28/2020	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	2.00
1/29/2020	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	0.25
			47.50 Subtotal
4/10/2019	Matt Thomas	Review	1.50
4/10/2019	Matt Thomas	Discussion	0.50
4/10/2019	Matt Thomas	Legal Research	3.00
4/18/2019	Matt Thomas	Legal Research	2.50
4/19/2019	Matt Thomas	Legal Research	2.00
6/19/2019	Matt Thomas	Legal Research	1.00
1/22/2020	Matt Thomas	Review	1.00
1/22/2020	Matt Thomas	Legal Research	2.50
			14.00 Subtotal
4/10/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	0.50
5/1/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	1.75
5/2/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Telephone calls	1.25

**Time by File
Beginning thru End**

A19-00336 - Tom Stulberg, et al v City - Zoning Lawsuit re: Lowertown

Date	Staff	Task	Hours
5/24/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	1.25
5/28/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	1.50
5/29/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	0.75
6/7/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Telephone calls	1.00
6/10/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	1.50
7/2/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	0.50
7/5/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	2.50
7/10/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	1.25
8/9/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	1.50
9/9/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	0.75
10/30/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Court	0.75
11/15/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	0.50
12/13/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	0.25
1/24/2020	Stephen K. Postema	Telephone calls	0.50
1/28/2020	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	0.25
			18.25 Subtotal
9/17/2019	Timothy S. Wilhelm	Review	1.00
9/18/2019	Timothy S. Wilhelm	Review	2.50
			3.50 Subtotal
			83.25 Grand Total Hours



CITY OF ANN ARBOR, MICHIGAN

301 E. Huron St., P.O. Box 8647, Ann Arbor, Michigan 48107-8647

Phone (734) 794-6170

FAX (734) 994-4954

www.a2gov.org

Office of The City Attorney

January 27, 2020

Sent Via Email

Susan Friedlaender
Friedlaender Nykanen & Rogowski PLC
1700 W. Big Beaver Road
Suite 350
Troy, MI 48084

RE: Status of *Stulberg et. al. v. City of Ann Arbor*

Dear Ms. Friedlaender,

As we discussed on Friday, our understanding is that after seeking the permission of your clients, you will dismiss *Stulberg and Ann Arbor Neighbors for Responsible Development, Inc. v. City of Ann Arbor* (Case. No. 19-281-CK) without prejudice by tomorrow.

As we discussed, there are councilmembers who have expressed an interest in sponsoring resolutions for the City Council to consider the following:

- Directing the Planning Commission to study and report on the appropriate use and scope of the C1A/R zoning district, along with a moratorium on rezonings to that district
- Directing the ZBA and Planning Commission to consider revisions to the City's variance standards, including variance standards for parking
- Directing the City Administrator and Parks Advisory Commission to make a specific recommendation regarding improvements to parks near 1140 Broadway using the parks contribution from the development.
- Create a parking plan for the area surrounding the 1140 Broadway development now, or to commit to take remedial action to resolve any significant issues with parking in this area in the future.

As I shared with you, the City Planning Commission's Ordinance Revisions Committee has already begun an evaluation of the effectiveness of the City's planned project standards and is discussing possible ordinance amendments as the Planning Commission identified this as ordinance that they wanted to refine.

If you have any questions about this matter, please do hesitate to let me know.

Sincerely,

A handwritten signature in black ink, appearing to read "Kevin McDonald", with a large, sweeping flourish extending to the right.

Kevin McDonald
Deputy City Attorney

Time by File
Beginning thru End

A18-00545 - Bannister and Kailasapathy v. City, Taylor, and Beaudry - Library Lot

Date	Staff	Task	Hours
7/23/2018	Abigail Elias	Uncoded	2.50
7/24/2018	Abigail Elias	Uncoded	3.50
			6.00 Subtotal
6/26/2018	Betsy Blake	Advice and Counsel to Client	0.50
8/8/2018	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	0.50
8/9/2018	Kevin S. McDonald	Review	1.25
			1.75 Subtotal
8/29/2018	Margaret Pollard Radabaugh	Discussion	0.25
6/19/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Meeting	3.75
6/21/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Review	1.25
6/25/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Draft Document	2.50
6/26/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Meeting	3.00
6/28/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Meeting	1.50
7/9/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Meeting	1.50
7/12/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Draft Document	6.00
7/13/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Draft Document	8.00
7/16/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Draft Document	3.75
7/17/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Draft Document	6.00
7/18/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Draft Document	7.75
7/19/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Draft Document	1.75
7/20/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Review	1.75
7/23/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Draft Document	6.75
7/24/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Review	4.75
7/25/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Draft Document	0.75
8/1/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Draft Document	2.00
8/2/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Draft Document	4.25
8/3/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Draft Document	4.00
8/8/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Draft Document	10.00
8/9/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Draft Document	5.50

**Time by File
Beginning thru End**

A18-00545 - Bannister and Kailasapathy v. City, Taylor, and Beaudry - Library Lot

Date	Staff	Task	Hours
8/10/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	File/Factual Matter Research	2.00
8/12/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Court Preparation	2.00
8/13/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Draft Document	6.25
8/14/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Court	3.00
8/15/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Draft Document	5.00
8/23/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Draft Document	1.25
8/25/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Draft Document	3.00
8/27/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Draft Document	5.50
8/28/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Draft Document	3.00
8/29/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Draft Document	5.50
9/3/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Court Preparation	3.00
9/4/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Discussion	3.25
9/5/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Court Preparation	5.50
9/17/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Draft Document	2.75
10/19/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Review	1.50
10/29/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Draft Document	3.50
10/30/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Draft Document	5.50
11/2/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Draft Document	6.25
11/5/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Review	1.00
11/6/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	File/Factual Matter Research	5.25
11/7/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Meeting	1.00
11/8/2018	Matthew R. Rechten	Meeting	5.00
1/4/2019	Matthew R. Rechten	Draft Document	3.00
1/8/2019	Matthew R. Rechten	Discussion	1.00
1/11/2019	Matthew R. Rechten	e-mail	0.50
1/15/2019	Matthew R. Rechten	Meeting	3.00
1/16/2019	Matthew R. Rechten	Draft Document	1.00
1/17/2019	Matthew R. Rechten	Draft Document	1.25
1/18/2019	Matthew R. Rechten	Deeds	1.00
			177.25 Subtotal
6/26/2018	Matt Thomas	Meeting	1.00
6/26/2018	Matt Thomas	Legal Research	1.50

Time by File
Beginning thru End

A18-00545 - Bannister and Kailasapathy v. City, Taylor, and Beaudry - Library Lot

Date	Staff	Task	Hours
6/26/2018	Matt Thomas	Review	1.00
6/28/2018	Matt Thomas	Meeting	1.00
6/28/2018	Matt Thomas	Legal Research	2.50
6/29/2018	Matt Thomas	Legal Research	2.00
8/1/2018	Matt Thomas	Legal Research	4.50
8/8/2018	Matt Thomas	Legal Research	3.50
8/9/2018	Matt Thomas	Legal Research	1.50
8/13/2018	Matt Thomas	Document Review	2.00
8/20/2018	Matt Thomas	Legal Research	3.00
8/24/2018	Matt Thomas	Legal Research	1.00
8/27/2018	Matt Thomas	Review	1.50
8/27/2018	Matt Thomas	Draft Document	1.00
9/4/2018	Matt Thomas	Court Preparation	0.50
10/24/2018	Matt Thomas	Review	1.00
10/24/2018	Matt Thomas	Legal Research	1.50
12/17/2018	Matt Thomas	Legal Research	2.50
12/18/2018	Matt Thomas	Legal Research	3.00
12/20/2018	Matt Thomas	Legal Research	1.50
			37.00 Subtotal
8/28/2018	Nancy L. Niemela	Review	0.75
6/18/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	2.00
6/19/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Discussion	4.50
6/21/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Discussion	1.50
6/25/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Discussion	2.50
6/26/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Meeting	2.50
6/27/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	1.50
6/28/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	1.50
6/29/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Discussion	3.00
7/6/2018	Stephen K. Postema	File/Factual Matter Research	3.50
7/9/2018	Stephen K. Postema	File/Factual Matter Research	3.75
7/10/2018	Stephen K. Postema	File/Factual Matter Research	2.50

Time by File
Beginning thru End

A18-00545 - Bannister and Kailasapathy v. City, Taylor, and Beaudry - Library Lot

Date	Staff	Task	Hours
7/11/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Draft Document	4.50
7/12/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Draft Document	2.75
7/13/2018	Stephen K. Postema	File/Factual Matter Research	1.75
7/16/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Discussion	2.50
7/17/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	2.50
7/19/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Discussion	3.75
7/20/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	3.50
7/24/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Legal Research	3.75
7/25/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Draft Document	2.75
7/25/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Draft Document	1.50
7/30/2018	Stephen K. Postema	File/Factual Matter Research	4.50
7/31/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Draft Document	4.50
8/1/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Legal Research	4.50
8/2/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Legal Research	3.50
8/3/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Legal Research	4.50
8/6/2018	Stephen K. Postema	File/Factual Matter Research	7.50
8/8/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Draft Document	5.50
8/9/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Court Preparation	7.50
8/10/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Draft Document	5.50
8/13/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Draft Document	6.50
8/14/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Court	1.50
8/15/2018	Stephen K. Postema	File/Factual Matter Research	5.50
8/16/2018	Stephen K. Postema	File/Factual Matter Research	3.50
8/24/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Court Preparation	5.50
8/27/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Draft Document	6.50
8/28/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Draft Document	5.50
8/29/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Court Preparation	5.75
8/31/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Court Preparation	3.50
9/4/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Legal Research	5.75
9/5/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Court	5.75
9/6/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	0.50
9/13/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Discussion	1.00

Time by File
Beginning thru End

A18-00545 - Bannister and Kailasapathy v. City, Taylor, and Beaudry - Library Lot

Date	Staff	Task	Hours
9/18/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Discussion	1.75
10/17/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Draft Document	1.50
10/18/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	3.50
10/23/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	1.00
10/24/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	1.00
10/29/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	3.50
10/31/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Legal Research	2.50
11/1/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	1.25
11/2/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Draft Document	1.25
11/3/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	0.75
11/6/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Draft Document	1.25
11/13/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Court	2.50
11/26/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Review	0.50
11/27/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Telephone calls	1.50
12/6/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	0.50
12/12/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Review	1.25
12/18/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	0.25
12/20/2018	Stephen K. Postema	Discussion	0.50
1/10/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	0.25
1/14/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	0.50
1/15/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	0.50
1/16/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	0.75
1/17/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	0.50
1/22/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	0.50
1/23/2019	Stephen K. Postema	Document Review	0.50
			192.00 Subtotal
			415.50 Grand Total Hours

Hanson/Renaissance Reporting & Video

400 Renaissance Center Suite 2160
Detroit, MI 48243
Phone: 313-567-8100
Fax: 313-567-4362



Matthew Rechten
Ann Arbor, City of
301 East Huron
6th Floor
Ann Arbor, MI 48109

Invoice #618686

Date	Terms
10/26/2018	Net 45

Assignment #124433 on 10/17/2018

Case: Bannister, Anne, et al. v. City of Ann Arbor,
et al.

Shipped On: 10/24/2018

Shipped Via: USPS Priority Mail
Provider: Rose, Dale E

Description	Price	Qty	Amount
Hearing Transcription			
Attendance (3 Hours)	\$ 30.00	1.00	\$ 90.00
(Hold) Original & Paper Copy (41 Pages)	\$ 4.50	1.00	\$ 184.50
Shipping	\$ 15.00	1.00	\$ 15.00
Emailed Transcript	\$ 10.00	1.00	\$ 10.00
			<hr/>
			\$ 299.50

Amount Due: \$ 299.50

Paid: \$ 0.00

Balance Due:	\$ 299.50
Payment Due:	12/10/2018

Interest after 45 days at 1.50%: \$ 303.99

THANK YOU **We accept all major credit cards**

"Payment Is Not Contingent On Client Reimbursement"

EIN: 38-2436945